Hargana Gouernment Gazette

EXTRAORDINARY
Published by Authority

© Govt. of Haryana
No. 14-2018/Ext.] CHANDIGARH, THURSDAY, JANUARY 25, 2018 (MAGHA 35, 1939 SAKA)

TRAON AR
JMEHRT TAT B fIHHT

g
fdi® 25 ST=aN, 2018
T 22 / QEI—2.— ERATOT AT IR AT HR AT, 2017 (2017 HT 19), B &RT 11 B U &R (1)
ERT U Wl BT YIRT &R 8Y, BRION & ISAUT, 9 a1 9 G 8 gU b U &=l SiHfed
IS 7, URYE HI BN W, $Hd §RI, BRAN WGBR, DN qAT HAGM [GHRT, ARG Hv=n
47 /THEI—2, T&AI® 30 [, 2017 H AT F=ATARIT Helg" $RA 8, FATq—

e
ERATVN ARBR, MBI qAT BRI [I9RT, IR G147 /TAS—2, &A% 30 S[F, 2017 ¥, RN

o
(@) PHF @ 3 B AW, W (3) B ufafie # RGN UERY” vl @ UvErd, AT RGN Heef”
NS CRTIIG
(@) ®F GE 3 3R 9D ArH gfdftedl & gwErq, efeRed w9 W iR swa wme ufafteat
T SO, srerfa—

(1) @) ®) (@) ()

3% | AT 99 | WAYM & AT 2438 & AqUd [hdl GaId Bl A1 GowE & | T | I
IgeUE 2439 B BT bl TR uiferdt & WU MY fHAT B
A GIRT B harha & A ¥ dd WROR, S ARBR
AT G IRETF AT R WSRO T TGN YIRS AT ARBR]
AT BT AT S dTel ATeT T2 Harsil & Ggdad e o A
HT IR WYFd USRI BT oI VW UG P Hed ¥ 25 Ufawd A
31 7 & |

(M)  PH G 16 & A, W (3) @ gfafe # Ue 9 vl & WIF W), i 99 ves gfoRenfud
febq g

(344)



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), JAN. 25,2018 (MAGH. 5, 1939 SAKA) 345

(=)

HH @ 19 IR IS A UfAfedt & varq, EfalRaa A e ik S AW ufafte

T SITgE, srerf—

(1)

) (3) @) |6

"19%

A | 9RA H Rerd ! ves aeliNg e ¥ IRA | I | 39 %4 91 H 41 T8

9965 | @ dTER Rerd el W\ ) % ART AT ®Ig A1 919 30 HawR,
BT GRIET B & AIH A A S dTell |y 2018 & 91§ AT el
BT |
199 | fif | wRa ¥ Rea fdt dweera Follo’y I 9 9Rd | I | 39 %A 9w § 41 T8
9965 | @ dTeR Ryd fofl M W Selae & ARy Aledl BIs W 91d 30 A=K,
HT aRTET A & AegH § & S aTell |qarg 2018 & 91§ AN e
Brfl |

(®)

HH AR 22 @ AHA, @ (3) @ ufafe H A% @) @ uwEn, EfaRed we < S,

JqTq—

"M foerem gd @ Rien ok STaar wrafie faenera a1 wHees 9@ @ e @& ArE | S
IATT UG HRAT arell QT Setfia vem & faenfeial, e iR srel @1 uRasd & |arg
U PHRaM drel B faenfial, Her iR sFiel & uRRdesd =g Arex asd”

HH G 29 R SHG AW gfdftedl @ v, fEfalRad v A iR Swe ame gfafteat
T SIEHT, ferfd—

() (3) @) ()
¥y 9971 BEII ARBR DI AHfed dHT AR & Jaid deved | 9 | I
a1 iy @ HHAIRAT P a6 U SWRA BS P AIH I Y&

9991 DI S arell A1 e by W @ fg weAfa & g

STra= 187 ey |

HH AT 36 B AT, W (3) B wfafte #H, #7g (1) #, UGN §9R” G B W W, Tl ARG
vreg gforenTfid fard SITe;

HH AT 36 3R SWD AW gfdftedl & v, fEfalRad w9 S iR Swe ame gfaftedt
T SOl srerfa—

@ ©) @) ()

o 9071 A1 | 9 w35 AT 36 H faffdse I ARl & g 9 | | 3

Y 9991 P HEIH | <7 ST dTell |d1g

()

HH @ 39 I A ufdftedl & yeErq, frefoRad oA W@ ¢k S¥a 9 gfdftea !
SO, arerf—

(1)

(3)

@)

()

"39%h

el 9g war arel Ry oY &M H sraRerd fawig ddril &

Rl TP $ev3Fe BreARkige Afdde] ¥ex  (Qsuhuas)

e 8, @ TART 9Rd & d1ex IfaRerd bl UEd Bl JIaRTER

i Jamell & foy 9RA™ vuy 9 =1 6T o=y ga1 4 &1 718

BEIN

IRAT— 39 Ul & Yo & foy, msunuad # fawia Jarer
P ARIRT ¥ AU TH Afdd A F,

() RN RT AR T IqT AEUHvE & fAf s &
forq forge foddt fafame gRT U1 a0 # srgAcd ar

H=IAT <) 8, A1

NS

i,
E 4




346

HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), JAN. 25,2018 (MAGH. 5, 1939 SAKA)

(1) 2) (3) () ()

(i) o faceh fafrome gdas (o fowi sar
P) fafme, 2015 & Sfdifd YR & d1ER BT DS
foarft aafaq @ TRIT B/, A

(iii) <7 fr wRdm dr fAfame on faers urferaRor
o o dar o) feem fadwr, 2015 @
I SMSYHTER a1 ARG & wd  H Yoiiad
ﬁ;,m

(iv) for W ufosfa den g e, (@d) 7 wRd
gfergfet denr i 9 (ot fawia <ar
oz faar—fder, 2015 & sfavid A w9 H srgAfd
TS @ B |

(31) P AT 45 B ATHS, G (3) D ufafte H —
() ¥ (@) H U 9 (i) & g, FfeRad SU A8 @ SITel, srrfd—
“(iil) DU WOR, I8 WOR, I qoUeld, AR YIEOERO, ARART ARG a1
RBNI HRT; ;
(i) ¥ (@) ¥ SU A< (i) & g, FFfRad U A8 W@ ST, srIfd—
“(iv) BT WREOR, IR WRER, dG Ao, W YIS, SRGRI UTfHRor a7
RGN AR
(i) w1 () # U A (i) & yvarq, fFrafaRad Su A @ e, rerfa—
“(iil) Du WOR, I8 WOR, TG AoIed, AT GG, RGN AIIHR a1
RGN ¥R,
@) @¥ A 53 3R SHG A ufafedl & gvarq, frefaRed oa dwn ik Swa e ufaftew
) SO, srerfa—

(1) @) @3) (@) ()
"53% | | Y IRl & JIRESAl H AT & "RIq ¥ & W arell 9ag | I | I
9985
@) P9 W= 54 & WA, @l (3) @ ufdfie # A (B) @ uwdr, fRad wq @ oo,
JqTq—

@) BN IR B RRSSH H gHT & ARIH H A S dTrell ] |
(8) ¥ T 60 & AW, W (3) @ ufafte #, “facer #arera” vt &1 @g fhar e,
(@) P WA 65 3R IWD AW Uldfedl & vearq, FfoRad H9 S iR S9a |+ ufaftear
T SOl srerfa—
(1) @) (3) (4) (5)

"65% | eNY | O BT ARHR AMFTIH, 2005 (2005 HT HF JRVH 22) & | T | I
9991 | 3fcHid SIHGNI UaTH &R & HIEgH I & S dloll Jdig

(UT) b AT 66 B AT, W (3) B wfafte #—
() ¥ (®) B gzan, FAfaRad Ag & S, srerfa—

“(@) el el HHATT TART YIS YPob & ©U H URhe & Yol § YJeT WRiel
AT B & I aTell HaT”;

(i) #< (@) "5-—

(@) U A (iv) ¥, "SR AEGHD TR qH” el BT A BR AT ST




HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), JAN. 25,2018 (MAGH. 5, 1939 SAKA) 347

(@) U A (iv) & g, ffeRad A @ SIEE, srerfa—
“(v) T@IHd Sed a1 GIRASHeT &1 i dTe Usr’;

M g H ulafe (@) e, Brod R AER & @I W), A8 (@) & SU A3 (i), (ii)
3R (iii)” TTE, BISd R AR B yfoRenfud faam S,

@) WP b TR, FEfRed uRd AT SIQI, i —
"IRg T8 IR P 7e (@) B SU AS (v) H & g FIg A 9 W WA W

SN TE B S T

() : gd e ok SeaR Arafie fJere R a6 a1 aHed Ren &
AT ;AT

(i) fHT orgHIeT EAdS Rie uedsd & R & w9 4 Rer & A |
U Al T B B,

@) wE = 77 & AW, @ (3) B ufafie | "] () W, " g9RT ¥Rl & I W, A d §9R
aier A vree gfaRenfid fhar S,

@) PF W= 81 & AFH, @ (3) # e ufafe & m wR, fm=feRea ufafe gftrenfua o
ST, srerfa—
“frfeRad # U991 & IfeR & ®U § @ S arell Harg—
(@) wod, T a1 Rgex— Foa R Aed a1 9o f Wi 2,

(@) WREPR TIRE NG FRE IR URwe ufaifr, i uee= ar &g $rer 99RE Sl
o AT HIeT THRE I A &,

(M) HICT 9T ST AR,
@) AR,

S8 S w4 (@), (@). (M) A1 (@) | g Ml TRE a1 W § U999 & Af¥eR 1 ufawd
g @) vu ufa cafed | s T 8

IR RS,
faey dfea, sRaon WReR,
STEHNT TAT BRI U |
HARYANA GOVERNMENT
EXCISE AND TAXATION DEPARTMENT
Notification

The 25th January, 2018
No. 22 /ST-2.— In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of section 11 of the Haryana Goods

and Services Tax Act, 2017 (19 of 2017), the Governor of Haryana, on being satisfied that it is necessary in the public
interest so to do, on the recommendations of the Council, hereby makes the following amendments in the notification
of the Haryana Government, Excise and Taxation Department, notification No. 47/ST-2, dated the 30th June, 2017,
namely:-

Amendment

In the Haryana Government, Excise and Taxation Department, notification No. 47/ST-2, dated the 30th June,

In the Table, -

(a)  against serial number 3, in the entry in column (3), after the words “a Governmental Authority” the
words “ or a Government Entity” shall be inserted;



348

HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), JAN. 25,2018 (MAGH. 5, 1939 SAKA)

(b)  after serial number 3 and the entries thereagainst, the following serial number and entries thereagainst
shall be inserted, namely: -
(1) ) 3) (4) 5)
“3A Chapter | Composite supply of goods and services in which the value Nil Nil”;
99 of supply of goods constitutes not more than 25 per cent. of
the value of the said composite supply provided to the
Central Government, State Government or Union territory
or local authority or a Governmental authority or a
Government Entity by way of any activity in relation to any
function entrusted to a Panchayat under article 243G of the
Constitution or in relation to any function entrusted to a
Municipality under article 243W of the Constitution.
(c)  against serial number 16, in the entry in column (3), for the words “one year”, the words “three years”
shall be substituted;
(d) after serial number 19 and the entries thereagainst, the following serial number and entries thereagainst
shall be inserted, namely: -
(D 2 3 “4) ®)
“19A Heading | Services by way of transportation of | Nil | Nothing contained in this

9965 goods by an aircraft from customs
station of clearance in India to a place

outside India.

serial number shall apply after
the 30™day of September,
2018.

19B Heading

Services by way of transportation of | Nil
goods by a vessel from customs station
of clearance in India to a place outside
India.

Nothing contained in this
serial number shall apply after
the 30™day of September,
2018.”;

9965

(e)

®

against serial number 22,in the entry in column (3), after item (b), the following item shall be added,
namely: -

“(c) motor vehicle for transport of students, faculty and staff, to a person providing services of
transportation of students, faculty and staff to an educational institution providing services by
way of pre-school education and education upto higher secondary school or equivalent.”;

after serial number 29 and the entries thereagainst, the following serial number and entries thereagainst
shall be inserted, namely: -

2 A3) 4) )

“29A

Heading
9971 or
Heading
9991

Services of life insurance provided or agreed to be provided | Nil
by the Naval Group Insurance Fund to the personnel of
Coast Guard under the Group Insurance Schemes of the
Central Government.

Nil”;

(g)  against serial number 36, in the entry in column (3), in item (c), for the words “fifty thousand”, the
words “two lakhs” shall be substituted,
(h)  after serial number 36 and the entries thereagainst, the following serial number and entries thereagainst
shall be inserted, namely: -
2 A3) “4) ®)
“36A | Heading Services by way of reinsurance of the insurance schemes Nil Nil”;
9971 or specified in serial number 35 or 36.

Heading
9991




HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), JAN. 25,2018 (MAGH. 5, 1939 SAKA) 349

@) after serial number 39 and the entries thereagainst, the following serial number and entries thereagainst
shall be inserted, namely: -

@) 2 A3) 4) ®)
“39A | Heading Services by an intermediary of financial services located in Nil Nil”;
9971 a multi services SEZ with International Financial Services

Centre (IFSC) status to a customer located outside India for
international financial services in currencies other than
Indian rupees (INR).

Explanation.— For the purposes of this entry, the
intermediary of financial services in [FSC
is a person,-

1) who is permitted or recognised as such by the
Government of India or any Regulator
appointed for regulation of IFSC; or

(i)  who is treated as a person resident outside
India under the Foreign Exchange
Management (International Financial
Services Centre) Regulations, 2015; or

(i) who is registered under the Insurance
Regulatory and Development Authority of
India (International Financial Service Centre)
Guidelines, 2015 as IFSC Insurance Office;
or

(iv)  who is permitted as such by Securities and
Exchange Board of India (SEBI)under the
Securities and Exchange Board of India
(International Financial Services Centres)
Guidelines, 2015.

) against serial number 45, in the entry in column (3),-
(1) in item (a), after sub-item (ii), the following sub-item shall be added, namely:-

“(@ii) the Central Government, State Government, Union territory, local authority,
Governmental Authority or Government Entity;”;

(il))  initem (b), after sub-item (iii), the following sub-item shall be added, namely:-

“@{v) the Central Government, State Government, Union territory, local authority,
Governmental Authority or Government Entity;”;

(iii)  initem (c), after sub-item (ii), the following sub-item shall be added, namely:-

“@ii) the Central Government, State Government, Union territory, local authority,
Governmental Authority or Government Entity.”;

(k)  after serial number 53 and the entries thereagainst, the following serial number and entries thereagainst
shall be inserted, namely: -

(1) ) (3) “4) (5)
“53A | Heading Services by way of fumigation in a warehouse of agricultural Nil Nil”;
9985 produce.

) against serial number 54, in the entry in column (3), after item (g), the following item shall be added,
namely:-

“(h) services by way of fumigation in a warehouse of agricultural produce.”;




350 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), JAN. 25,2018 (MAGH. 5, 1939 SAKA)

(m) against serial number 60, in the entry in column (3), the words “the Ministry of External Affairs,” shall
be omitted;

(n)  after serial number 65 and the entries thereagainst, the following serial number and entries thereagainst
shall be inserted, namely: -

() @ €) (4) (5)

“65A | Heading Services by way of providing information under the Right to Nil Nil”;
9991 Information Act, 2005 (22 of 2005).

(o)  against serial number 66, in the entry in column (3),-
1) after item (a), the following item shall be inserted, namely:-

“(aa) by an educational institution by way of conduct of entrance examination against
consideration in the form of entrance fee;”;

(i)  initem (b),-
(A)  in sub-item (iv), the words “upto higher secondary” shall be omitted;
(B) after sub-item (iv), the following sub-item shall be added, namely:-
“(v) supply of online educational journals or periodicals:”;

(C) in the proviso, for the word, brackets and letter “entry (b)”, the words, brackets and
letters “sub-items (i), (ii) and (iii) of item (b)” shall be substituted;

(D) after the proviso, the following proviso shall be added, namely:-

“Provided further that nothing contained in sub-item (v) of item (b) shall apply to an
institution providing services by way of,-

(1) pre-school education and education up to higher secondary school or equivalent;
or

(il)  education as a part of an approved vocational education course.”;

(p)  against serial number 77, in the entry in column (3), in item (c), for the words “five thousand”, the
words “seven thousand five hundred” shall be substituted;

(q)  against serial number 81, for the entry in column (3), the following entry shall be substituted, namely: -
“Services by way of right to admission to-
(a) circus, dance, or theatrical performance including drama or ballet;

(b) award function, concert, pageant, musical performance or any sporting event other than a
recognised sporting event;

(c) recognised sporting event;
(d)  planetarium,

where the consideration for right to admission to the events or places as referred to in items (a), (b), (c)
or (d) above is not more than Rs 500 per person.”.

ASHIMA BRAR,
Special Secretary to Government Haryana,
Excise and Taxation Department.

55941—C.S.—H.G.P., Chd.




